
CAREER FAIR  

Sponsored by   

  NORTH CAROLINA DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

   DIVISION OF ADULT CORRECTION/JUVENILE JUSTICE 

 

 

 

Saturday 

August 20, 2016 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 

Warren Correctional Institution   

379 Collins Road 

Manson, NC 27553 

Phone: 252-456-3400 

 
Superintendent Kevin Barnes (Warren CI) 

Administrator John Hamlin (Polk CI) 

Correctional 

Officer I  

Minimum/Medium 
Custody Unit 
Newly Increased Starting 
Salary $30,856  
 

Minimum Hiring 
Requirements High School 
or GED diploma, at least 20 
years of age, possess a valid 
driver license, pass a criminal 
background check, and/or an 
equivalent combination of 
education and experience 

 
Correctional  

Officer II  

Close Custody Unit 
Newly Increased Starting 
Salary $ 31,904 
 
Minimum Hiring 
Requirements as above 
and one or more of the 
following: 
-2 or 4 year degree in any 
field, and/or 
 

Minimum of 1 Year 
Experience in at least one 
of the following areas: 
-Military and/or National 
Guard  
- Any sworn law enforcement 
or juvenile detention 
experience at the federal, 
state, county, or municipal 
level  
-Correctional or 
Probation/Parole Officer 
within NC or any state. 
-Certified Detention Officer  
-Certified Hospital Security 
 

Applicants Strongly 
Encouraged  

To Apply Online   
 

http://workfornc.gov 
 

 

 

Tobacco products (including 

lighters), cell phones, 

weapons, purses, & 

containers are not permitted  

within the facility.  A valid 

photo ID & appropriate 

attire will be required 

to participate in a tour. 

(Long pants, T-shirt/blouse, 

knee length dresses, etc.) 

Tank tops, spandex, shorts, 

halter tops, and any clothing 

found to be offensive  

will be considered 

inappropriate. 

 

DPS Offers 

Career 

Advancement 

Opportunities 

With Excellent 

Benefits! 

Health Insurance 

Paid Holidays 

Retirement Plan, 

Paid Vacation & 

Sick Leave, 

401K, Military 

Leave, Veterans 

Apprenticeship 

Program 

Recruiting for: 

Warren & Polk 

 Correctional Institution 

Correctional Officer I  

Health Services- RN’s  

Staff/ Senior Psychologist  

Correctional Case Manger 
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